


 

Molalla TMDL Plan 

 POLLUTANT: Temperature City of Molalla: TMDL Implementation Tracking Matrix 

SOURCE 
What 
sources of 
this 
pollutant 
are under 
your  
jurisdiction? 

STRATEGY 
What is being 
done, or what will 
you do, to reduce 
and/or control 
pollution from this 
source? 

HOW 
Specifically, how will this 
be done? 

FISCAL 
ANALYSIS 
What is the 
expected 
resource need? 
Are there 
existing 
resources 
budgeted? If 
not, where will 
the resources 
come from? 

MEASURE 
How will you 
quantitatively or 
qualitatively 
demonstrate 
successful 
implementation 
or completion of 
this strategy? 

TIMELINE 
When do you 
expect it to be 
completed? 

MILESTONE 
What 
intermediate 
goals do you 
expect to achieve, 
and by when, to 
know progress is 
being made? 

ADAPTIVE 
MANAGEMENT 
APPLIED 
Indicate how 
strategies have 
changed with 
annual review 
reports. 

STATUS 
Include 
summary 
and date. 

Lack of 
shading in 
riparian 
areas 

Protect and 
enhance existing 
vegetation in 
riparian areas. 

Enforce existing 
Municipal Code17-2.4.030 
for new development:  50 
ft. riparian and wetland 
setback and protection of 
native vegetation. 

Code 
enforcement 
staffing; 0.20 
FTE is currently 
funded. 

Track 
enforcement 
actions and 
violations as well 
as development 
plan review. 

 
Record square 
footage of 
riparian area 
protected with 
all 
development. 

On-going; 
code adopted 

Retain all 
existing riparian 
vegetation on 
developments 
planned through 
2020, as required 
by Municipal 
Code 
17-2.4.030. 
Report areas 
protected in 
annual TMDL 
review report. 

No changes 
made to code 
or application 
of code. 

Protection of 
riparian areas 
adhered to 
with 
development 
of Bear Creek 
Subdivision 
and Twin 
Meadows 
Subdivision 

Lack of 
shading in 
riparian 
areas 

Protect and 
enhance existing 
vegetation in 
riparian areas. 

Implement Phase 1 of 
Bear Creek Greenway 
Project. Approximately 
7,500 LF of 8-10’ wide 
pathway through 
private industrial and 
residential lands. 

$480,000 

Completion of 
trail from 
Molalla Forest 
Rd. to Molalla 
city limits. 

5-15 years 

Annual review of 
budget for 
possible 
implementation or 
private 
development. 
Report funding 
status in annual 
TMDL review 
report. 

No changes 
made to code 
or application 
of code. 

Included 
bicycled and 
pedestrian 
pathway along 
north side of 
Molalla Forest 
Road as part of 
draft TSP 
update. No 
development 
projects along 
corridor. 



 

Molalla TMDL Plan 

Lack of 
shading in 
riparian 
areas 

Protect and 
enhance existing 
vegetation in 
riparian areas. 

Conduct public education 
on protection of riparian 
areas. 

Staffing to 
conduct 
educational 
effort; 0.20 FTE 
currently 
funded. 

Number of bill 
inserts and 
website postings. 

 
Number of 
meetings. 

On-going 

Educational 
outreach once per 
year through 
2020. Provide 
outreach details 
in annual TMDL 
review report. 

No change. 

Continued 
education of 
development 
community 
and property 
owners during 
pre-application 
meetings. 

Lack of 
shading in 
riparian areas 

Protect and enhance 
existing vegetation 

Tree protection as required 
by City Code 17- 
3.4.030. 

Staffing as 
required for plan 
review and 
enforcement. 

Track 
enforcement 
actions and 
violations as well 
as number of 
existing trees 
retained with 
each 
development. 

On-going 

Maintain all 
existing trees, 
where possible, 
on new 
development as 
required by 
Municipal Code 
17-3.4.030. Provide 
project list and tree 
protection details 
in annual TMDL 
review report. 

No changes 
made to code or 
application of 
code. 

Community 
Planner 
continued 
enforcement of 
development 
code on all 
projects. 

Lack of 
shading in 
riparian areas 

Partner with 
watershed groups 
and Clackamas SWCD 
where possible. 

Establish a working 
relationship with Clackamas 
SWCD and watershed 
groups where possible. 

Staffing to 
conduct 
educational 
effort. 

Number of 
meetings 
attended and 
projects 
completed in 
partnership 
with watershed 
groups, number 
of site visits 
performed, 
times bill-
inserts are 
included. 

5 years 

Attend at least 
one meeting 
annually through 
2020. Provide list 
of meetings 
attended in annual 
TMDL review 
report. 

No change. 

No 
coordination 
since adoption 
of 5 year plan 
in April 2018. 

Lack of 
shading in 
riparian areas 

Partner on riparian 
restoration/enhancement 
projects. 

Volunteer and 
staffing as 
required. 

5 years 

Contribute to at 
least one project 
by end of 2020. 
Report on funding 
status/availability 
in annual TMDL 
review report. 

No change. 

Initial 
investigation 
into possible 
riparian 
projects with 
Clackamas 
SWCD. 
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Lack of 
shading in 
riparian areas 

Partner on public 
education/outreach 
opportunities. 

Volunteer and 
staffing as 
required. 

5 years 

Participate in at 
least one public 
outreach with 
partner by end of 
2020. Provide 
outreach details in 
annual TMDL 
review report. 

No change. 

No coordinate 
since adoption 
of 5 year plan 
in April 2018. 

Lack of 
shading in 
riparian areas 

Tree planting 
Enforce tree planting and 
landscaping by way of 
Municipal Code 17.3.4. 

In City budget for 
Code enforcement 
staffing. 

Number of trees 
planted and 
Area landscaped. 

On-going 

Establish list of 
projects that 
provided new trees 
and landscape 
areas through 2020 
and include in 
annual TMDL 
review. 

No changes 
made to code or 
application of 
code. 

Community 
Planner 
continued 
enforcement 
of 
development 
code on all 
projects. 

Stormwater 

City Council 
overview and 
acknowledgement
. 

Review TMDL Plan, 
annual reports and five 
year review with City 
Council. 

None 

Track number of 
times TMDL 
reports are 
covered in City 
Council meeting 
minutes. 

On-going 

City Council 
approval of TMDL 
Plan and review 
reports. 

No change. 

Reviewed 
draft TMDL as 
part of 
03/14/18 
meeting. 

Reduced 
stream flow 
in Molalla 
River and 
tributaries 

Reduce 
municipal water 
diversion. 

Water conservation efforts 
driven primarily by public 
education. 

Staffing to 
conduct 
educational 
effort; 0.15 FTE 
currently 
funded. 

Number of bill 
inserts mailed. 

 
Number public 
service 
announcements. 

 
Monitor total 
water use. 

On-going 

Educational 
outreach once a 
year through 
2020. 

 
Water use 
reported annually 
and provided in 
annual TMDL 
review report. 

No change. 

2017 Water 
Quality Report 
completed and 
posted to the 
website Spring 
2018. (See 
attached) 
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Wastewater 
treatment 
plant 
discharge 

Maintain low 
effluent 
temperatures
. 

Maintain compliance with 
NPDES permit 
requirements. 

Wastewater 
treatment 
staff; funded 
positions. 

Molalla River 
temperature 
monitoring. 

Continuous 
temperature 
measurement; 
monthly 
permit 
reporting. 

Report instream 
temperature 
monitoring with 
annual TMDL 
report review. 

No change. 

See attached 
DMR’s. 
Monitoring 
stopped in 
May with 
transition to 
land 
application. 

 

POLLUTANT: Bacteria, Mercury, and Legacy Pesticides City of Molalla: TMDL Implementation Tracking Matrix 

SOURCE 
What 
sources of 
this 
pollutant 
are under 
your 
jurisdiction? 

STRATEGY 
What is being 
done, or what will 
you do, to reduce 
and/or control 
pollution from this 
source? 

HOW 
Specifically, how will 
this be done? 

FISCAL 
ANALYSIS 
What is the 
expected 
resource need? 
Are there 
existing 
resources 
budgeted? If 
not, where will 
the resources 
come from? 

MEASURE 
How will you 
quantitatively or 
qualitatively 
demonstrate 
successful 
implementation or 
completion of this 
strategy? 

TIMELINE 
When do you 

expect it to be 
completed? 

MILESTONE 
What intermediate 
goals do you expect 
to achieve, and by 
when, to know 
progress is being 
made? 

ADAPTIVE 
MANAGEMENT 
APPLIED 
Indicate how 
strategies have 
changed with 
annual reports. 

STATUS 
Include 
summary and 
date. 

Stormwater 

Promote Low 
Impact 
Development and 
on-site stormwater 
treatment. 

Encourage green 
street standards – at 
least half street 
improvements with 
new development. 

 
Meet pre-
development 
hydrology 
requirements per 
Municipal Code 17-
3.6 and Public 
Works Design 
Standards Section 
3.2. 

Currently in 
Public Works 
budget. 

Percent of green 
street standards for 
each project. 

 
For each project, 
stormwater 
quantity 
calculations to 
meet pre-
development 
hydrology and 
water quality 
requirements per 
PW Standards. 

On-going 

All new 
development plans 
incorporate green 
street standards 
where practical and 
include pre- 
development 
hydrology. Report 
applicable 
improvements in 
annual TMDL review 
report. 

No change. 

No new 
development 
applications 
during this 
reporting 
period. 



 

Molalla TMDL Plan 

Stormwater 

Promote Low 
Impact 
Development and 
on-site stormwater 
treatment. 

Incorporate 
stormwater 
treatment with 
transportation 
projects: 
e.g. Fenton Ave. 

Included in city 
budget according 
to capital 
improvement 
plan. 

Number of 
stormwater 
treatment features 
installed. 

2020 
Fenton Ave. Project 
Completion in 2018. 

No change. 

Two water 
quality swales 
incorporated 
into design. 

Stormwater 

Promote Low 
Impact 
Development and 
on-site stormwater 
treatment. 

Encourage use of 
drainage swales that 
settle, infiltrate, and 
treat turbid runoff. 
Current Public Works 
Design Standards 

Section 3.5 provides 

design specifications 
for drainage swales. 

Currently in City 
planning budget 
for plan review. 

Track number of 
projects that 
incorporate drainage 
swales. 

On-going 

Add drainage swales 
installed to GIS 
Stormwater map by 
end of 2020. Report 
number of water 
quality facilities 
constructed in 
annual TMDL review 
report. 

No change. 

Two water 
quality swales 
incorporated 
into Fenton 
design. GIS 
work 
scheduled. 

Stormwater 
Reduce pet waste in 
stormwater runoff. 

Install waste bags in 
parks and common 
dog-walking 
locations. 
 
Citizen education 
about improper pet 
waste management. 

Currently in 
Parks budget. 

Number of citizen 
complaints. 
 
Track refill need at bag 
holders. 

On-going 

Report complaint 
number and bag use 
in annual TMDL 
review report. 

No change. 
Purchased 
3,026 Mutt-
Mitts 

Stormwater 

Educate developers 
and the public about 
stormwater and 
hydrology in the City 
of Molalla. 

Make Stormwater 
Master Plan and 
Public Works Design 
Standards available 
to public via City 
website. 

None 

Number of private 
development that 
meet stormwater 
standards. 

On-going 

All Private 
development 
projects meet 
stormwater 
detention and water 
quality 
requirements. 
Report number of 
water quality 
facilities constructed 
in annual TMDL 
review report. 

 

No change. 

No new 
development 
applications 
during this 
reporting 
period. 



 

Molalla TMDL Plan 

Stormwater 
Prevent erosion from 
construction sites. 

Conduct grading 
inspections per 
Municipal Code 
21.70 to ensure 
protection against 
erosion. 

Currently in Public 
Works budget. 

Percent of sites that 
comply voluntarily. 

Ongoing 

Report number of 
permitted 
excavation projects 
and compliance with 
Municipal Code 
21.70 in annual 
TMDL review report. 

No change. 

No new 
development 
applications 
during this 
reporting 
period. 

Stormwater 
Prevent erosion from 
construction sites. 

Cooperate with DEQ 
to enforce erosion 
control through 
1200C permits as 
required by 
Municipal Code - 
Chapter 17 and 
Public Works Design 
Standards 1.18.4. 

Currently in Public 
Works budget. 

Keep track of 1200C 
permits within City 
boundaries. 

On-going 

Report number of 
1200C permits in 
annual TMDL review 
report. 

No change. 

No new 
development 
applications 
during this 
reporting 
period. 3 
permits still 
active. 

Stormwater 

Reduce runoff and 
sediment load 
from impervious 
areas: roads, 
vacant lots. 

Maintain weekly 
street sweeping 
schedule. 

Currently in 
Public Works 
budget. 

Using street 
sweeping log, track 
frequency of areas 
cleaned. 

On-going 

Report volume 
estimate of street 
sweepings in annual 
TMDL review report. 

No change. 
Approximately 
50 CY since 
plan approval. 

Stormwater 

Maintenance 
Program for 
stormwater 
collection system. 

Maintain storm 
system components 
including; catch 
basins, manholes 
and pipes. 

Currently in 
Public Works 
budget. System 
Development 

Charges in place 

for storm 
drainage 
system. 

Track maintenance 
projects that 
improve 
stormwater 
system. 
 
Construct Decant 
Facility as funding 
allows. 

On-going 

Indicate number 
and type of 
maintenance 
projects in annual 
TMDL review report. 

 
Provide funding 
status for Decant 
facility in annual 
TMDL review 
report. 

No change. 
Decant Facility 
budgeted for 
FY 18-19. 

Stormwater 
City Council 
overview and 
acknowledgement. 

Review TMDL Plan, 
annual reports and 
five year review 
with City Council. 

None 

Track number of 
times TMDL reports 
are covered in City 
Council meeting 
minutes. 

On-going 

Staff review of 
approved TMDL 
Plans with City 
Council. 

No change. 

Reviewed draft 
TMDL as part 
of 03/14/18 
meeting. 



 

Molalla TMDL Plan 

Lack of 
riparian 
vegetation; 
eroding 
streambanks 

Restore riparian 
vegetation and 
streambanks. 

Implement Phase 1 of 
Bear Creek Greenway 
Project. 
Approximately 
7,500 LF of 8-10’ wide 
pathway through 
private industrial and 
residential lands. 

$480,000 

Completion of trail 
from Molalla Forest 
Rd. to Molalla city 
limits. 

5-15 years 

Annual review of 
budget for possible 
implementation or 
private 
development. 
Report funding 
status in annual 
TMDL review report. 

No change. 

Included 
bicycled and 
pedestrian 
pathway along 
north side of 
Molalla Forest 
Road as part of 
draft TSP 
update. 

 

Lack of 
riparian 
vegetation; 
eroding 
streambanks 

Restore riparian 
vegetation and 
streambanks. 

Partner with 
watershed groups 
on riparian 
restoration/ 
enhancement 
projects. 

Staffing to 
conduct effort; 
0.10 FTE 
currently 
funded; 
volunteer 
contributions. 

Number of 
projects/efforts 
completed in 
partnership with 
watershed groups. 

5 years 

Contribute to at 
least one project by 
end of 
2020. Report on 
funding 
status/availability in 
annual TMDL review 
report. 

No change. 

Initial 
investigation 
into possible 
riparian 
projects with 
Clackamas 
SWCD. 

Lack of 
riparian 
vegetation; 
eroding 
streambanks 

Protect and 
enhance existing 
vegetation in 
riparian areas. 

Enforce existing 
Municipal Code 17-
2.4.030 for new 
development:  50 ft. 
riparian and 
wetland setback 
and protection of 
native vegetation 

Code 
enforcement 
staffing; 0.25 
FTE is currently 
funded. 

Track enforcement 
actions and 
violations as well as 
development plan 
review. 
 
Record square 
footage of riparian 
area protected with 
all development. 

On-going; 
code 
adopted 

Retain all existing 
riparian vegetation 
on developments 
planned through 
2020, 
as required by 
Municipal Code 17- 
2.4.030. Report 
areas protected in 
annual TMDL 
review report. 

No change. 

No 
enforcement 
actions or new 
development 
during this 
period. 



 

Molalla TMDL Plan 

Cross 
connections 
of storm and 
sanitary 
sewers 

Increase 
effectiveness and 
efficiency of 
wastewater 
treatment. 

Eliminate illicit 
discharge and 
infiltration issues in 
downtown core. 

To be 
determined. 

Average daily flow 
to treatment plant 
before and after 
cross connect issues 
addressed. 

5 years 

Complete 
Wastewater 
Facilities Plan in 
2018. 
 
Report completion 
of plan and cross 
connection projects 
in annual TMDL 
review report. 
Include annual 
review of budget for 
cross connection 
projects. 

No change. 

Draft master 
plan hearing 
scheduled for 
August 1st. 
Smoke testing 
and 105 
manhole 
repairs to SS 
system. 
Removed 4 SS 
to storm cross 
connections. 

Cross 
connections 
of storm and 
sanitary 
sewers 

Decommission 
Septic Systems per 
Municipal Code 
13.08.300 – Upon 
Availability of 
Public Sewer – 
Abandonment of 
Private Systems. 

Administer 30 day 
notice to connect to 
city sewer where 
public sewer is 
made available. 

Planning staff, 
full time. 

Number of new 
connections made 
annually as a result 
of annexations, 
violations 
discovered. 

On-going 

Connect all 
residential, 
commercial, 
industrial 
properties within 
city limits to city 
sewer and report 
in annual TMDL 
review report. 

No change. 
None during 
reporting 
period. 

Illegal 
Discharge 

Porta potties at 
parks in summer 
with no facilities 
and public events. 

Porta potties 
provided for public 
use in parks and 
areas with no public 
facilities. 

Currently in City 
budget for City 
funded events. 

Track number of 
porta potties used 
for events. 

On-going 

Report number of 
City funded events 
requiring porta 
potties in annual 
TMDL review 
report. 

No change. 
None during 
reporting 
period. 
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Illegal 
Discharge 

Code enforcement 
of Municipal Code 
13.08.840 – 
Discharge Into 
Storm Drains. 

Provide code 
enforcement form 
to citizens. 

Currently in City 
budget for 
Operations 
Supervisor. 

Track number of 
complaints. 

On-going 

Code enforcement 
form has been 
made available on 
the City of Molalla 
website.  Report 
number of 
complaints 
received and 
corrective actions 
taken in annual 
TMDL review 
report. 

No change. 
None during 
reporting 
period. 
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City of Molalla 

117 N. Molalla Ave. 

Molalla, OR  97038 
 

City of Molalla 
Annual Water Quality Report  

for Calendar Year 2017 
 

We are pleased to report that our water is safe and 

continues to meet or exceed Federal and State requirements. 

The U.S. Environmental Protection Agency (EPA) requires all 

community water systems to provide customers with a water 

quality report each year.  Molalla’s water comes from the 

Molalla River several miles upstream of the city and is treated 

at the Molalla Municipal Water Treatment Plant.  The Molalla 

River watershed encompasses a total of about 203 square miles 

and provides us with an extremely clean source of surface 

water.  A source water assessment is available for customer’s 

review. 

 

Drinking water, including bottled water, may 

reasonably be expected to contain at least small amounts of 

some contaminants. The presence of contaminants does not 

necessarily indicate that water poses a health risk. More 

information about contaminants and potential health effects 

can be obtained by calling the EPA’s Safe Drinking Water Hotline 

(1-800-426-4791). 
 

Important Message From the EPA: 

Some people may be more vulnerable to contaminants in 

drinking water than the general population. Immuno-

compromised persons such as persons with cancer undergoing 

chemotherapy, persons who have undergone organ transplants, 

people with HIV/AIDS or other immune system disorders, some 

elderly, and infants can be particularly at risk from infections. 

These people should seek advice about drinking water from 

their health care providers. EPA/CDC guidelines on appropriate 

means to lessen the risk of infection by Cryptosporidium and 

other microbial contaminants are available from the Safe 

Drinking Water Hotline (800-426-4791). 
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We have been testing the quality of your water for many years.  Currently there are about 

100 water quality standards for potential contaminants in drinking water supplies in Oregon.  

Of these, a few contaminants have been detected in our drinking water at levels well below 

maximum acceptable levels set by the State and EPA as indicated in the following table: 
 

 

 

 

                                                                              TEST RESULTS 

Contaminant Violation 

Y/N 

Level  

Detected 

Unit 

Measurement 
MCLG MCL Likely Source of  

Contamination 

Microbiological Contaminants 

Turbidity N 0.690 

Highest 

single  

measurement 

NTU N/A TT=NTU’s  

95%<0.3 

100%<1.0 

Soil Runoff 

Unregulated VOC’s 

Chloroform N 10.2 ppb N/A N/A Byproduct of the  

Treatment Process 

Bromodichloromethane N 1.1 ppb N/A N/A Soil Runoff 

Inorganic Contaminants  

Nitrate N 0.120 ppm 10 10 Fertilizer, Septic Tanks,  

Erosion 

Disinfection Byproducts 

Halo Acetic Acids 

(HAA5) 

N 18.8 ppb 

 

0 

 

60 Byproducts of  

Disinfection Process 

TTHM 

(Total Trihalomethanes) 

N 17.9 ppb 

 

0 

 

80 Byproducts of  

Disinfection Process 

Chlorine 

 

Sodium Hypochlorite  

N 1.60 (Max  

Level detected) 

ppm MRDLG =  

4.0 

MRDL =  

4.0 

Used for Chlorination /  

Disinfection 

Lead and Copper Results 

Substance Units Action 

Level 

90th 

Percentile 

Homes  

Exceeding  

Action Level 

Complies Likely Source of  

Contaminations 

Lead ppb 15 3.0 0 Y Corrosion of  

Household Plumbing 

Copper ppm 1.3 0.0 0 Y Corrosion of  

Household Plumbing 
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Table Definitions 
(What It All Means…) 

 

MCLG: (Maximum Contaminants Level Goal)   

The level of contaminant in drinking water below 

which there is no known or expected risk to 

health.  MCLG’s allow for a margin of safety. 
 

MCL: (Maximum Contaminants Level)               

The highest level of contaminants that is allowed 

in drinking water.  MCL’s are set as close to the 

MCLG’s as feasible using the best available 

treatment technology. 
 

AL: (Action Level)  The concentration of a 

contaminant which, if exceeded, triggers 

treatment or other requirements which a water 

system must follow. 
 

TT: (Treatment Technique):  A required process 

intended to reduce the level of a contaminant in 

drinking water. 
 

Turbidity:  A measure of the cloudiness of the 

water and is a good indicator of water quality.  

High turbidity can hinder the effectiveness of 

disinfectants such as chlorine. 
 

MRDL: (Maximum Residual Disinfectant Level) 

The highest level of a disinfectant allowed in 

drinking water. There is convincing evidence that 

addition of a disinfectant is necessary for control 

of microbial contaminants. 
 

(MRDLG): (Maximum Residual Disinfectant Level 

Goal)  The level of a drinking water disinfectant 

below which there is no known or expected risk 

to health. MRDLG’s do not reflect the benefits of 

the use of disinfectants to control microbial 

contamination. 
 

ppb: Parts per Billion  |  ppm: Parts per Million 
  

      NTU = Nephelometric Turbidity Unit 

 

 

 

 
 

Opportunities for Public Participation:  Residents are always welcome to attend city council meetings, 

which are normally the 2nd and 4th Wednesday’s of each month. For more info, please visit our website. 
 

Opportunities for public participation:  Residents are always welcome to attend city council 

Pollution Prevention 

What Can You Do to Help Improve 

Molalla’s Waterways? 

 

Lawn and Garden Care – Skip the weed and feed. 

Chemicals are harmful to children and pets. Rain can 

wash chemicals off your lawn and into storm drains 

and streams. 
 

Vehicle/Car – Maintain your vehicles to reduce oil 

and fluid leaks. 
 

Pressure Washing – Be stream friendly when 

cleaning your home, deck, sidewalk and driveway. 

Pollutants from cleaning activities can flow into storm 

drains and ditches directly into our rivers and streams. 
 

Pick Up After Your Pets -  Proper disposal of pet 

waste helps to minimize bacteria in our City’s streams. 

Pet waste can contain pathogens such as Giardia, E. 

coli, Salmonella, and Campylobacter. These can cause 

illness in humans, especially children and the elder. 

Always pick up after your pet when on walks, avoid 

children’s play areas, and remember to pick up in your 

own yard, too. 
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 for lead and copper was performed in September 2015.  Tests at the 90th percentile were 3.0 ppb lead and 0.0 

ppm copper.  If present, elevated levels of lead can cause serious health problems, especially for pregnant women and 

young children. Lead in drinking water is primarily from materials and components associated with service lines and 

home plumbing.  The City of Molalla is responsible for providing high quality drinking water, but cannot control the 

variety of materials used in plumbing components. When your water has been sitting for several hours, you can minimize 

the potential for lead exposure by flushing your tap for 30 seconds to 2 minutes before using water for drinking or 

cooking. If you are concerned about lead in your water, you may wish to have your water tested. Information on lead in 

drinking water, testing methods, and steps you can take to minimize exposure is available from the Safe Drinking Water 

Hotline or at www.epa.gov/safewater/lead. 
 

Samples are routinely collected from numerous points in the distribution system and then tested.  State certified operators 

collect the samples, which are then tested at state certified laboratories.  We constantly monitor for various constituents in 

the water supply to meet all regulatory requirements.  
 

The sources of drinking water (both tap water and bottled water) include rivers, lakes, streams, ponds, reservoirs, springs, 

and wells. As water travels over the surface of the land or through the ground, it dissolves naturally-occurring minerals and, 

in some cases, radioactive material, and can pick up substances resulting from the presence of animals or from human 

activity. Contaminants that may be present in source water include: 
 

 Microbial contaminants, such as viruses and bacteria, which may come from sewage treatment plants, septic systems, 
agricultural livestock operations, and wildlife. 
 

 Inorganic contaminants, such as salts and metals, which can be naturally-occurring or result from urban stormwater runoff, 
industrial or domestic wastewater discharges, oil and gas production, mining, or farming. 
 

 Pesticides and herbicides, which may come from a variety of sources such as agriculture, urban stormwater runoff, and 
residential uses. 
 

 Organic chemical contaminants, including synthetic and volatile organic chemicals, which are byproducts of industrial 
processes and petroleum production, and can also come from gas stations, urban stormwater runoff, and septic systems. 
 

 Radioactive contaminants, which can be naturally-occurring or be the result of oil and gas production and mining activities. 
 

In order to ensure that tap water is safe to drink, EPA prescribes regulations which limit the amount of certain contaminants 
in water provided by public water systems. Food and Drug Administration regulations establish limits for contaminants in 
bottled water which must provide the same protection for public health. 

 

http://www.epa.gov/safewater/lead
http://www.nsf.org/
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⁰C SU MGD mg/L lbs mg/L lbs ⁰C SU MGD mg/L mg/L lbs mg/L lbs mg/L mg/L mg/L mg/L mg/L lbs mg/L mg/L CFS ⁰C
Su 1 6.8 1.718 11.4 7.6 0.997 14.92 9 0.74 0.00 37 1330 9.5 1
M 2 12 6.7 1.631 11.0 7.6 1.003 15.10 9 0.74 0.00 0 1 38 1370 9.1 2
T 3 11.5 6.7 1.518 140 1771.15 207 2614.31 10.7 7.5 1.010 15.08 5 96 44 5 98 42 24 1.93 0.00 34 1240 9.9 3
W 4 10.8 6.7 1.405 11.0 7.7 0.664 12.29 14 1.78 0.00 39 1160 9.6 4
Th 5 11.9 6.7 1.774 125 1844.96 211 3121.78 11.3 7.5 0.818 11.96 4 97 27 6 97 41 18 1.75 0.00 41 1200 11.5 5
F 6 13.7 6.8 1.641 12.0 7.5 0.655 14.92 14 1.76 0.00 48 1730 11.3 6

Sa 7 6.6 2.648 12.4 7.5 0.753 14.70 18 1.95 0.00 71 2540 11.4 7
Su 8 6.5 4.258 11.2 7.5 0.684 15.20 15 1.83 0.00 167 6140 8.9 8
M 9 12.8 6.6 2.753 11.5 7.6 0.835 15.09 16 1.54 0.00 0 79 146 5320 8.0 9
T 10 13.1 7.1 2.411 98 1960.5 209 4192.46 12.6 7.5 0.940 14.80 5 95 36 5 98 39 19 1.66 0.00 2 5 100 3580 10.5 10
W 11 12.6 6.6 2.590 12.4 7.5 0.837 14.60 12.70 11.60 0.40 81.60 0.08 22 2.11 0.00 84 2960 10.3 ND Oil & grease/ TDS 114 MG/L 11
Th 12 12.5 6.6 3.496 62 1794.59 100 2901.09 11.7 7.5 0.800 15.00 8 86 56 8 92 53 21 2.14 0.00 81 2950 10.6 BOD5 concentration is estimate 12
F 13 12.9 6.6 2.728 11.4 7.6 1.317 15.26 28 1.72 0.00 79 2930 10.6 13

Sa 14 6.7 2.390 11.6 7.6 1.528 15.04 33 1.76 0.00 76 2770 10.6 14
Su 15 6.6 2.980 11.4 7.5 1.647 15.14 15 0.75 0.00 72 2640 11.1 15
M 16 12.7 6.5 2.570 10.9 7.6 1.646 15.26 10 0.52 0.00 3 12 74 2740 8.3 16
T 17 12.9 6.6 2.462 105 2160.08 121 2479.37 10.1 7.6 1.546 15.33 7 94 87 7 94 87 28 1.46 0.00 67 2480 9.8 17
W 18 12..9 6.7 2.469 11.4 7.5 1.506 14.90 28 1.53 0.00 61 2200 9.7 18
Th 19 13.2 6.6 2.100 87 1514.96 111 1944.05 11.6 7.5 1.524 14.63 6 93 74 8 93 102 38 2.01 0.00 55 1930 10.7 19
F 20 13.5 6.7 1.902 12.4 7.5 1.343 14.35 24 1.44 0.00 49 1690 10.0 20

Sa 21 1.560 13.2 7.5 1.632 14.35 7 0.36 0.00 44 1540 10.7 21
Su 22 6.6 1.737 13.6 7.5 1.513 13.61 23 1.22 0.00 47 1540 8.7 22
M 23 13.7 6.6 1.566 14.7 7.5 1.527 12.94 22 1.16 0.00 0 34 45 1420 8.6 23
T 24 14.3 6.6 1.423 117 1386.16 199 2355.76 14.9 7.5 1.673 12.77 7 94 96 5 98 63 29 1.42 0.00 42 1300 11.1 24
W 25 14.2 6.9 1.362 15.8 7.5 1.606 12.28 24 1.24 0.00 40 1200 12.0 25
Th 26 14.6 6.8 1.338 137 1528.77 137 1528.77 17.2 7.5 1.654 11.47 8 94 108 6 96 79 18 0.87 0.00 45 1260 12.3 Grab sample. BOD5 concentration is estimate 26
F 27 14.5 6.9 1.344 16.5 7.5 1.677 11.82 28 1.37 0.00 45 1300 12.1 27

Sa 28 6.8 1.321 16.8 7.5 1.744 11.92 30 1.41 0.00 41 1190 10.4 28
Su 29 6.9 1.350 16.2 7.5 1.694 10.98 33 1.59 0.00 43 1150 10.6 29
M 30 14.7 7 1.196 16.1 7.5 0.898 11.57 19 1.76 0.00 0 241 40 1110 10.1 shut down WWTP 30

31
61.641 13961.2 21137.6 37.671 528 506 636 0

10.8 6.5 1.196 62 1386.16 100 1528.77 10.1 7.5 0.655 10.98 4 27 5 39 12.7 11.6 0.4 7 0.36 0.00 0 1 34 1110 8
14.7 7.1 4.258 140 2160.08 211 4192.46 17.2 7.7 1.744 15.33 8 108 8 102 12.7 11.6 0.4 38 2.14 0.00 3 241 167 6140 12.3

7.7 8 528 8 506 6140
13.1 2.055 109 1745.15 162 2642.2 12.8 1.256 13.91 6 94 66 6 96 63 12.7 11.6 0.4 81.6 0.083 21 1.45 0.00 1 62 61.77784 2130.33 10.2667

6.0-9.0 320 320 25.9 0.18 406
18⁰	C 15 240 15 240 >350

10 >85% 160 10 >85% 160 16.7 0.07 126
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EPA Reference #
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MOLALLA RIVER

Adam Shultz

Facility Name
I certify under penalty of law that this document and all attachments were prepared under my direction or supervision in 
accordance with a system designed to assure that qualified personnel properly gather and evaluate the information 
submitted. Based on my inquiry of the person or persons who manage the system, or those persons directly responsible for 
gathering the information, the information submitted is, to the best of my knowledge and belief, true, accurate, and 
complete. I am aware that there are significant penalties for submitting false information, including the possibility of fine and 
imprisonment for knowing violations.

4369 / IV
12190/II

Robert Dillard

Operator Certification

TSS
INFLUENT EFFLUENT

BOD NUTRIENTSTSS

DEQ Permit #
Plant Type

5/4/18 Robert J. Dillard
Date Name 

Legally Authorized Signature
9960

57613

Breakdowns, bypassing, odors, complaints, etc.

Total
Daily Min

CFU/100 mL

DISINFECTION COLIFORM
RECEIVING STREAM

Chlorinecomposite composite
BOD






